
FOIA Review
October 25, 2023

Requestor Information Requested Hours/Cost

Janine Asmus
Libraryfoia@gmail.com

September 11, 2023

Burr Ridge, Illinois

Please identify (by employee name and
work email address) each and every
District employee who is certified as a
school librarian (meaning they have the
school library licensure and/or
endorsement in library media) and who is
currently working in that capacity in your
District's library/libraries/media centers this
academic school year.

Please note that a "certified school
librarian" may also be called a "District
Librarian," "certified media specialist," or
an "information specialist." This request is
NOT seeking parent volunteers or support
staff members who are non-certified and
working in a school library.

The purpose of the request is to identify
the number of certified school librarians
working in Illinois Public School Districts.

30 Minutes= $15.98

Mikayla Lukasiewicz
mikayla@safewayfirst.com

September 19, 2023

Can you please provide the following
public records in accordance with the
Freedom of Information Act:

1. Copy of current regular and sped
school transportation contracts
2. Copy of current regular and sped
school transportation extension contracts
3. Copies of all school transportation
invoices for May 2023, July 2023, and
August 2023.

30 minutes= $17.53

Smart Procure
sreid@smartprocure.com
September 26, 2023

SmartProcure is submitting a commercial
FOIA request to the Grayslake Community
Consolidated School District No. 46 for any
and all purchasing records from 6/28/2023
to current. The request is limited to readily

1 Hour= $45.05

mailto:Libraryfoia@gmail.com
mailto:mikayla@safewayfirst.com
mailto:sreid@smartprocure.com


available records without physically
copying, scanning or printing paper
documents. Any editable electronic
document is acceptable.

The specific information requested from
your record keeping system is:

1. Purchase order number. If purchase
orders are not used a comparable
substitute is acceptable, i.e., invoice,
encumbrance, or check number
2. Purchase date
3. Line item details (Detailed description of
the purchase)
4. Line item quantity
5. Line item price
6. Vendor ID number, name, address,
contact person and their email address

Daily Herald
jgriffin@dailyherald.com

September 27, 2023

Copies of, or documents sufficient to show,
all invoices, costs and reports related to
the district’s radon testing and retesting
done at district buildings between 2018
through today.

Copies of, or documents sufficient to show,
all invoices, costs and reports regarding
remediation of radon contamination in any
of the district buildings between 2018
through today.

15 minutes= $8.77

Allium Data
publicrecords@alliumdata.com

October 11, 2023

A copy of the last property & casualty
insurance renewal summary for all lines of
insurance purchased by the school district
(general liability, auto, workers comp,
professional, directors and officers, etc.).
This document summarizes the insurance
terms, limits, deductibles, premium and
exclusions.

A copy of the last employee benefits
insurance renewal summary for health,
dental, and vision plans sponsored by the

30 minutes= $17.53
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school district. This document shows plan
options available to the district’s
employees and the pricing for employee,
employee plus spouse, employee plus
family.


